
 
 

 

 
 

 
 

 
Nutgrove Villa 

Westmorland Road 
Huyton 

Liverpool 
Merseyside 

L36 6GA 
 

0151 244 4126 

Chair: Dr Andrew Pryce Chief Executive: Dianne Johnson 

Knowsley.CCGCommunications@knowsley.nhs.uk 

 

Our ref: FOI 1819_154 
 
Date:   11th December 2018 
 
Email:  knowsley.ccgcommunications@knowsley.nhs.uk 
 
 
Freedom of Information Request 
 
Please find below the response to your recent Freedom of Information request. 
 
Request / Response: 
 
For the avoidance of doubt, when referring to the 'mental ill-health', please include; 
anxiety, depression, personality disorder, severe affective disorders, schizophrenia, 
and mental ill-health that causes challenging behaviour, all of which are to such a 
degree that the person experiences significant impairment and as such is unable to 
care for themselves independently. This list is meant as a guide and is by no means 
exhaustive. 
 
1. Please provide the name, job title, email address and telephone number of the 

commissioner with responsibility for neurological rehabilitation and mental health 
placements (if more than one person is responsible, please provide the details of 
all responsible for making the placements). 
 
NHS Knowsley CCG’s senior officer responsible for neurological rehabilitation 
and mental health placements is: 
John Edwards 
Senior Program Manager for Mental Health 
Knowsley Clinical Commissioning Group 
1st Floor, Nutgrove Villa 
Westmorland Road 
Huyton 
Liverpool L36 6GA 
Office Telephone - 0151 244 3147 
E-mail - John.edwards@knowsleyccg.nhs.uk 
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2. Please provide the total number of adults funded by the authority in the following 
settings: (please provide figures for the past four financial years and budgeted 
figures for the current financial year (2018/19)  
 
a) Inpatient neurological rehabilitation settings 

  
NHS Knowsley CCG does not have details of the patient numbers. NHS 
Knowsley CCG commissions inpatient neurological rehabilitation services as part 
of the Cheshire and Merseyside Neuro Rehab Network. Each of the CCG that 
form the network are able to access beds when required and this task is directly 
undertaken by the Cheshire and Merseyside Neuro Rehab Network on behalf of 
the CCG. Please see the table below for a breakdown of the commissioning 
arrangements for the Cheshire and Merseyside Neuro Rehab Network. Please 
note that the details in the table are given in total beds purchased by the entire 
network - 

 

Unit 

Number of  
beds 
commissioned 

Walton Centre 40 

St Helens and Knowsley Hospitals 
(Seddon Suite) 20 

Broadgreen (Phoenix unit) 15 

Oak Vale Gardens 16 

Merseycare (Sid Watkins) 10 

 
The CCG is able to provide the number of patients in independent 
neurological hospital settings as these are commissioned separately from the 

Cheshire and Merseyside Neuro Rehab Network. Please see the table below – 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

b) Inpatient mental ill-health settings 
 

NHS Knowsley CCG commissions’ inpatient mental ill-health services from both 
North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust (NWB) and Mersey 
Care NHS Foundation Trust (Mersey Care). NHS Knowsley CCG does not hold 
details of the patient numbers.  

 
In each of the years specified NHS Knowsley CCG commissioned a set number 
of beds from each trust. These were 33 beds from North West Boroughs 
Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust and 8.5 beds from Mersey Care NHS 
Foundation Trust.  

  

2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 

2018/19 
budget 
(forecast) 

1 1 2 2 2 
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The CCG would advise that you contact both North West Boroughs 
Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust and Mersey Care NHS Foundation 
Trust directly to request this information. Contact details for the Trusts are-   
 
 Information Governance and Clinical Coding  
 Finance and Informatics Directorate  
 North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust  
 Hollins Park House  
 Winwick  
 Warrington  
 WA2 8WA  
 foi@nwbh.nhs.uk 
 
 Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust,  
 Communications Office, 
 V7 Building  
 Kings Business Park,  
 Prescot,  

Merseyside  
 L34 1PJ 

freedomofinformation@merseycare.nhs.uk 
  
The CCG is able to provide the number of patients in independent hospital  
settings, as detailed in the table below – 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
c) Neurological rehabilitation nursing home settings  
 
NHS Knowsley CCG does not directly commission neurological rehabilitation 
nursing home settings. These are the responsibility of Knowsley Local Authority. 
The CCG would advise that you contact Knowsley Local Authority directly to 
request this information. Contact details for Knowsley Local Authority are – 
Customer Liaison Team, 
Knowsley Council, 
Archway Road, 
Huyton 
L36 9YU 
foi@knowsley.gov.uk 

 
d) Mental ill-health nursing home settings  
 
As above. 

 

2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 

2018/19 
budget 
(forecast) 

11 18 23 25 25 
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3. Please provide the gross total expenditure on adults funded by the authority in 
the following settings: (please provide figures for the past four financial years 
and budgeted figures for the current financial year (2018/19) 

 
a) Inpatient neurological rehabilitation settings  

 
 The gross total expenditure on adults funded by the CCG in inpatient 
 neurological rehabilitation settings is detailed in the table below – 
 
 
 

Unit 2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 2018/19 
(forecast) 

 
Walton Centre* 

  
n/a  

  
n/a 

    
773,986  

             
811,444  

     
1,165,176  

 
Seddon Suite 

            
422,063.34  

             
428,926  

       
436,647  

             
440,140  

         
443,661  

 
Broadgreen 

            
238,065.82  

             
241,937  

       
246,292  

             
248,262  

         
250,248  

OakVale 
Gardens 

 
149,760 

 
149,760 

 
149,760 

 
149,760 

 
149,760 

Independent 
sector 

                     
42,275  

             
173,985  

       
195,223  

               
98,168  

         
171,020  

 *Please note this is the budget for the Walton Centre and may include 
 outpatient elements. 
 
 Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust’s Sid Watkins Unit forms part of the 
 trust’s block contract. Therefore the CCG is unable to provide a specific  
 expenditure for this provision. 
  

b) Inpatient mental ill-health settings 
 
The gross total expenditure on adults funded by the CCG in inpatient mental 
ill-health settings is detailed in the table below – 
 

 
2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 

2018/19 
budget 
(forecast) 

NWB  The Bed price for Acute Mental Health beds provided by NHS 
Providers is included in the Block service commissioned; therefore 
we are unable to provide the price paid for these specific settings.  Mersey Care 

Independent  
               
1,787,248  

         
1,413,244  

    
1,284,189  

         
2,422,838  

     
2,310,302  

 
 
c) Neurological rehabilitation nursing home settings  

 
NHS Knowsley CCG does not directly commission neurological rehabilitation 
nursing home settings. These are the responsibility of Knowsley Local 
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Authority. The CCG would advise that you contact Knowsley Local Authority 
directly to request this information. Contact details are as question 2c. 

  
d) Mental ill-health nursing home settings 
 
As above. 

 
e) Please provide a list of providers that currently receive this funding in each of the 

following settings: 
a) Inpatient neurological rehabilitation settings  

 
The current list of providers is – 

 The Walton Centre NHS Foundation Trust, 

 St Helens and Knowsley Teaching Hospitals NHS Trust  

 Royal Liverpool and Broadgreen University Hospitals NHS Trust 

 Partnerships in Care (Oak Vale) Limited 

 Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust 

 Brain Injury Rehabilitation Trust (BIRT) 

 TRU 
 

b) Inpatient mental ill-health settings 
 
The current list of providers is – 

 North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust  

 Mersey Care NHS Foundation Trust 

 Cygnet Health 

 KR Health and Social Care 

 Elysium Healthcare  

 Partnerships in Care 
 

c) Neurological rehabilitation nursing home settings  
 
NHS Knowsley CCG does not have this information. The CCG would 
advise that you contact Knowsley Local Authority directly to request this 
information. Contact details are as question 2c. 
 

d) Mental ill-health nursing home settings  
 

As above  
 

5. Please provide the current average weekly expenditure per individual for 
adults funded by the authority in the following settings: 

 
a) Inpatient neurological rehabilitation settings 
 
 NHS Knowsley CCG does not have this information. 
 
b) Inpatient mental ill-health settings  
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Financial expenditure relating to inpatient mental ill-health settings for both 
North West Boroughs Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust and Mersey Care 
NHS Foundation Trust forms part of each trust’s block contract, therefore 
we do not have an average price per week per patient.  
 
The average expenditure per individual in independent hospital settings 
per week ranges from £1,972 to £5,124 (exclusive of specialist nursing). 
 
c) Neurological rehabilitation nursing home settings  

 
NHS Knowsley CCG does not have this information. The CCG would 
advise that you contact Knowsley Local Authority directly to request this 
information. Contact details are as question 2c. 
 
d) Mental ill-health nursing home settings  
 
As above 

 
6. Of the total number of adults funded by the authority in inpatient neurological 

rehabilitation units (question 2a) please provide the total number that were 
placed in: (please provide figures for the past four financial years and 
budgeted figures for the current financial year (2018/19)) 
a. NHS hospital units  

 
NHS Knowsley does not hold this information. 
 

b. Independent provider hospital units  
 
NHS Knowsley has funded the following number of patients in 
independent provider inpatient neurological rehabilitation hospital settings, 

as detailed in the table below – 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

2014/15 2015/16 2016/17 2017/18 

2018/19 
budget 
(forecast) 

1 1 2 2 2 


